
 

 

Town of Oakland 
Board of Mayor and Aldermen 

Regular MeeƟng 
Thursday, July 18, 2024 

7:00 P.M. 
Town Hall Courtroom 

AGENDA 
 

I.  Call to Order 
 
II. Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance 
 
III.  Establish Quorum 
 
IV.  Approval of Agenda/ AddiƟons or DeleƟons 
 
V. Approval of Minutes 
 
 June 20, 2024 – Regular Board MeeƟng Minutes 
 
 June 29, 2024 – Special Call MeeƟng Minutes 
 
VI. Special Item: 
 
VII. CiƟzen Comments 

“Open for any Oakland ciƟzens to be heard on items and concerns.  CiƟzens are to be 
recognized by Chair and come to front of room before speaking.  Each speaker shall state 
their name and address for the record.  The Mayor and Board of Aldermen shall make no 
decision or consideraƟon of acƟon of ciƟzen comments, except to refer to the Town 
Manager for administraƟve consideraƟon or to schedule the maƩer for Mayor & Board 
of Aldermen consideraƟon at a later date.  Speakers shall limit their comments to three 
(3) minutes unless allowed by Chair.  Speaker shall limit their comment to one (1) 
subject.” 

 
VIII. Comments from the Mayor 
 
IX.  Comments from the Aldermen 
 
 Vice Mayor Wiggins Aldermen Cates Aldermen Fisher  
 Aldermen SuƩon Aldermen Hummel 
 
 
 



 

 

X. ConsideraƟon of Department Director Reports: 
 
 Police  Fire Finance  Recorder  Water Wastewater Public Works 
 Building and Codes Planning & Development Parks & Rec 
XI.  Town Manager’s Report 

  
XII. Old Business: Ordinances Second and Final Reading 
 None 
 
XIII. New Business: Ordinances on First Reading  
  

A. Ordinance 24-08 Amending Municipal Code Title 12 InternaƟonal Energy ConservaƟon 
Code 

 
XV. ConsideraƟon of ResoluƟons:  Old Business  
 None 

 
XVI. ConsideraƟon of ResoluƟons:  New Business 

A. Road Paving Priority List 

B. ResoluƟon 24-50 Authorizing the SolicitaƟon of Bids for 2024 Roadway Improvements  
 
C. ResoluƟon 24-51 Authorizing A Professional Services Agreement for 2024 Roadway   

Improvements 
 

XVI. Other Items of Business Items 
 

A. Appointment of Finance Director 
 

B. Establish Time and Date of Work-Session 
 
XVII. Approval of Invoices 
 
XVIII. MoƟon to Adjourn 



 

 

Mayor & Board of Aldermen – Regular Meeting 

Meeting Minutes 
June 20, 2024 

Present: Mayor Michael Brown 
 Vice Mayor Wiggins, Aldermen Cates, Fisher, Hummel & Sutton 

  
Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance to the American Flag 

  
  

1. Call to order by Mayor Brown 
2. Prayer & Pledge of Allegiance to the American Flag  
3. Establish Quorum   

All present 
4.  Approval of Agenda   

Town Manager Ellis requested to add under Other Items of Business, “Discussion of Small 
Business”. 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the agenda as amended.  Alderman 
Sutton seconded the motion.  All were in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed. 

5. Reading and Correction/Approval of Minutes of Regular Board  
 
May 16, 2024 – Beer Board Meeting Minutes  
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the May 16, 2024 Beer Board Meeting 
Minutes. Alderman Hummel seconded the motion.  All were in favor, none opposed.  The 
motion passed.  

May 16, 2024 – Regular Board Meeting Minutes  

Vice Mayor Wiggins requested revisions (Page 2, 3rd paragraph; and, in addition, reflect 
the name of the official seconding the motion to hear, on ordinances).  Vice Mayor 
Wiggins made a motion to table May 16, 2024 Regular Meeting Minutes for revisions. 
Alderman Sutton seconded the motion.  All were in favor, none opposed.  The motion 
passed. 

NOTE** Revised minutes will be presented at the May 29, 2024 Special Call Meeting.    

June 6, 2024 – Special Call Board Meeting Minutes  

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the June 6, 2024 Special Call Meeting 
Minutes. Alderman Cates seconded the motion, with Alderman Fisher abstaining from 
vote, due to his absence of Jun 6th meeting.  Four were in favor, one abstained.  The 
motion passed.  



Meeting Minutes, June 20, 2024 
Page 2 

 

 

6. Special Item: 

None. 

7. Citizen’s Comments  

John McFarland – 7660 Hwy 64 – Asked the Board to consider a 90-day moratorium on 
banners and signs for Oakland’s Small Business, due to downturn of the economy. 

Oakland Fire Lt. Josh Rakowsky – 830 Clay Pond – Lt. Rakowsky presented each official an 
envelope announcing his resignation. 

Sandra Iungerich- 10 Blackhill Cv.- Request the Board’s consideration of eliminating  
fluoride in the town’s drinking water, stating it is unnecessary risk and cost to citizens.    
 
8.   Communications from the Mayor  

Mayor Brown reminded everyone of the town’s annual Fourth of July fireworks display on 
June 29th.   Everyone was encouraged to attend. 

9. Communication from the Aldermen  

Alderman Cates expressed thanks to the Fayette County Ambulance Service in their prompt 
response to an emergency call placed involving one of his family members. 

Alderman Sutton added to Mr. Cates comments, that the town should consider offering CPR 
classes to its citizens, through Oakland’s Fire Department; suggesting CPR classes are 
generally focused on adult CPR training and not necessarily on babies and small children.  

Vice Mayor Wiggins acknowledged the first day of summer, Independence Day and vacation 
travels.  He wished everyone well, and a safe and enjoyable summer. 

10.  Department Head Reports  

Vice Mayor Wiggins congratulated the Oakland Water Department on its TDEC Inspection 
score of 97 out of 100.   
 
Vice Mayor Wiggins asked Fire Chief Walls to explain the difference between Mutual Aide and 
Automatic Aide.  Chief Walls stated Automatic Aide relates Fire Response and Mutual Aide as 
Medical Response. 
 
Vice Mayor Wiggins inquired of Public Works Director Mullins report, stating 37 garbage cans 
were delivered; and, asked if it is his department’s responsibility to deliver them?  Mr. 
Mullins explained that Team Waste delivers the cans to the impound lot, and Public Works 
delivers them each Tuesday, to new residents and to citizens requesting additional can(s).  
Vice Mayor Wiggins tasked Town Manager Ellis with logging the time and expense associated 
in Oakland staff performing the duties of the contractor. 



Meeting Minutes, June 20, 2024 
Page 3 

 

 

11.Town Manager Report 

Town Manager Ellis presented a time-lapse video of the construction taking place related to 
the Water Treatment Plant project.   

Alderman Hummel requested that still-shots of this presentation to be posted on Oakland’s 
Face-Book page if possible. 

12.    Old Business: Ordinances Second & Final Reading 

A. Ordinance 24-02 Amending Fiscal Year 2024 Budget- Solid Waste Fund 
 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear Ordinance 24-02.  Alderman Fisher seconded the 
motion to hear. 

Alderman Fisher made a motion to approve the 2nd Reading of Ordinance 24-02.  Alderman 
Hummel seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed. 

 
B. Ordinance 24-03 Amending Oakland Municipal Code Title 15, Chapter 6 – Parking 

Vehicles on Residential Streets and Residential Lots  
 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear Ordinance 24-03.  Alderman Fisher seconded the 
motion to hear. 
 

Alderman Fisher made a motion to approve the 2nd Reading of Ordinance 24-03.  Alderman 
Hummel seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed. 
 

 
C. Ordinance 24-04 Amending Oakland Municipal Code Title 15, Chapter 6 – Storage 

and Parking of Tractor Trailers on Commercial and Residential Lots 
 

Alderman Fisher made a motion to hear Ordinance 24-04.  Alderman Hummel (Rounds) 
seconded the motion to hear. 

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the 2nd Reading of Ordinance 24-04.   
Alderman Sutton seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed. 

 
D. Ordinance 24-06 Amending Fiscal Year 2024 Budget- Sewer Fund 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear Ordinance 24.06.  Alderman Cates seconded the 
motion to hear. 

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the 2nd Reading of Ordinance 24-06.   
Alderman Sutton seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed. 



Meeting Minutes, June 20, 2024 
Page 4 

 

 

13.    New Business: Ordinances First Reading – Public Hearing 

 None 
        

      14.  Consideration of Resolutions:  Old Business 
 

A. Resolution 24-37 Uncollected Utility Bills – Write off to Bad Debt 
 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 

Alderman Fisher made a motion to approve Resolution 24-37.  Alderman Hummel seconded 
the motion.  The motion passed 3 in favor, 2 opposing. A roll call vote was requested, voting 
in favor were Fisher, Hummel and Wiggins.  Opposing votes were Sutton and Cates. 
Resolution 24-37 passed. 

 
  15.  Consideration of Resolutions:  New Business 
 

A.  Resolution 24-43 Amend Municipal Code Title 12, Chapter 1 Building Permit Fee 
Schedule 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 
Town Manager Ellis cited two necessary changes of the resolution as written.  #1 – Title 13 in     
heading to be changed to “Title 12”; and referencing - Section 1 - insert “Residential” before 
commercial.  During discussion, Alderman Sutton requested clarification of the current 
Commercial Building Permit, Mr. Ellis responded, 15 cents per square foot is correct. 

 
Alderman Sutton made a motion to approve Resolution 24-43 as amended.  Alderman 
Hummel (Rounds) seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-43 
passed.   

 
B.  Resolution 24-44 Water and Sewer Rate Study 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve Resolution 24-44 as amended.  Alderman 
Cates seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-44 passed.   

 
C.  Resolution 24-45 Riverwood Gardens Development Agreement Phase 7 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 
Alderman Sutton addressed construction entrance to development and Mewborn Road 
improvement.  Mayor Brown determined the roads would be addressed later. 
 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve Resolution 24-45.  Alderman Sutton 
seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-45 passed.   



Meeting Minutes, June 20, 2024 
Page 5 

 

 
 
D.  Resolution 24-46 Riverwood Gardens Inspection Agreement Phase 7 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 
Alderman Sutton made a motion to approve Resolution 24-46.  Vice Mayor Wiggins 
seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-46 passed.   

  
E.  Resolution 24-47 Riverwood Gardens Development Agreement Phase 8 

 
Alderman Fisher made a motion to hear.   
 
Alderman Sutton made a motion to approve Resolution 24-47.  Vice Mayor Wiggins 
seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-47 passed.   

 
F.  Resolution 24-48 Riverwood Gardens Inspection Agreement Phase 8 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve Resolution 24-48.  Alderman Fisher seconded 
the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-48 passed.   

 
G.  Resolution 24-49 Bulldog Construction – Contract Extension Request 

  
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   
 
Alderman Cates made a motion to accept a three-year contract, approving Resolution  
24-49.  Alderman Fisher seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-49 
passed.   
 

              16.  Other Items of Business 
              

A.  Discussion of Small Business  
       

Town Manager Ellis opened the floor for discussion in waiving fees allowing small businesses 
to promote their business with banners and sign advertisements. 
 
Alderman Sutton made a motion contingent upon legal review and input, to suspend 
Temporary Sign Permit Fees for existing businesses until January 1, 2025, allowing them to 
put up a temporary sign, not to exceed 32 sq. feet in size, for business advertisement.  Vice 
Mayor Wiggins seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed.   
 

B.   Establish Time and Date of Work-Session 
 
 Town Manager Ellis offered the discussion of an Industrial Development Board as a topic.   



Meeting Minutes, June 20, 2024 
Page 6 

 

The Board discussed and determined not to have a work session in the month of July. 
 

 15.   Approval of Invoices  

None  
 

              16. Meeting Adjourned  

              Alderman Cates made a motion to adjourn the meeting.  

                                                        Date: June 20, 2024 
 
 

         ______________________  __________________________ 
    H. Michael Brown, Mayor   K. Yvonne Bullard, City Recorder   



 

 

Mayor & Board of Aldermen –Special Call Meeting, 10:00 A.M. 

Meeting Minutes 
 June 29, 2024 

Present: Mayor Michael Brown 
Vice Mayor Wiggins 
Aldermen Frank Cates, Jeff Fisher, Debbie Hummel & Ken Sutton  

  
  

1. Call to Order 

Mayor Brown called the meeting to order.  
 

2. Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance  
 

3. Establish Quorum 
 
All Present.  

 
4. Approval of Agenda 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the agenda as presented.  Alderman Sutton seconded 
the motion.  Three (3) were in favor and two (2) opposed.  Those voting in opposition were Alderman 
Fisher and Alderman Hummel.  The motion passed.   

 
5. Approval of May 16, 2024 Regular Minutes  

May 16, 2024 Regular meeting minutes were tabled during Jun 20, 2024 meeting for corrections 
requested by Vice Mayor Wiggins.  

 
A motion was made by Vice Mayor Wiggins to approve the corrected May 16, 2024 meeting minutes.  
Alderman Cates seconded the motion.  All voted in favor, none opposed. The motion to approve the 
May 16, 2024 minutes passed. 

 
Note: Alderman Hummel asked that the record reflect, she abstained from the initial vote, due to a 
family emergency causing her to leave the May 16, 2024 meeting. 

 
6. Old Business:  Ordinance Second and Final Reading -Public Hearing 

 
A. Ordinance 24-01 Adopting Annual Budget and Establishing Tax Rate for FY25. 

 
A public hearing was opened by Mayor Brown.    

 
John Finn, 100 Acadia Circle, inquired of FY25 salaries compared to FY23 and FY24, an approximate 
$1m increase.  Mayor Brown stated the budget included a 5% raise to employees; Alderman Sutton 



 
Meeting Minutes, June 29, 2024 
Page 2 

 

commented there are departments that have a salary structure in place, which pay scales are based 
on training, education and certifications, contributing to the increase more than 5%.  Town Recorder 
Yvonne Bullard mentioned Directors positions had been established within that time period and are 
reflected in the increase.  
 
The public hearing was closed. 

 
Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear Ordinance 24-01.  Alderman Sutton seconded the motion.  
None opposed. 

 
Town Manager Ellis directed attention to the General Fund, where funding of the construction 
drawings for the new town hall and police facility ($896,000) is allocated, as directed by the Board.   
Mr. Ellis added, the property tax remains unchanged at .6342.     

 
A motion to approve Ordinance 24-01 FY25 Budget and Establishing Tax Rate was made by Vice Mayor 
Wiggins.  Alderman Sutton seconded the motion. Four (4) were in favor and one (1) opposed.  The 
opposing vote was cast by Alderman Fisher.  The motion to approve the 2nd Reading of Ordinance  
24-01 passed in a four to one vote.     

7. New Business: Ordinance First Reading 
 

A. Ordinance 24-07 DE Annexation of Certain Parcel Along Hwy 64 North 
 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear Ordinance 24-07.  Alderman Sutton seconded the motion.  
None opposed.  

Town Manager Ellis explained Ordinance 27-04 was being presented for consideration due to the 
potential cost of providing sewer to the northside of Hwy 64.  

 
Alderman Hummel expressed concern, especially for the individuals living in the proposed area, in the        
notice given to the public related to such an important topic.  She proposed the ordinance to be 
tabled until citizens are educated on the effects this vote will have, and proper notice is provided 
allowing everyone to attend the 1st reading, as well as the 2nd reading. 

 
When asked, Attorney Minor assured the Board that “the minimum requirements were met for the 1st 
reading” of Ordinance 24-07.  
 
Alderman Fisher stated he had not received the information until “yesterday” afternoon, not allowing 
adequate time for the Board to review and ask questions. 
 
Vice Mayor Wiggins established the effects of this ordinance as, involving 4 neighborhoods, no 
businesses and approximately $200,000 in cost to bore under Hwy 64.  He asked Mr. Ellis if it would 
be safe to assume that, if the service was provided to the area, it would cost the town in excess of 
$1m.  Mr. Ellis agreed further stating it would cost each homeowner $10,000-$12,000 to retrofit their 
existing system allowing it to tie into the new system. 



 
Meeting Minutes, June 29, 2024 
Page 3 

 

 
Attorney Minor spoke to the items and issues that must be addressed prior to moving forward with 
the 2nd reading of Ordinance 24-07; a detailed survey and a corresponding map, formal letters sent to 
each property owner and certain surrounding property owners, and a publication in the Fayette 
Falcon at least 15 days prior to the public hearing at the 2nd reading.  He reiterated there were 
“substantial notice requirements to be met before the 2nd reading”.  
 
Alderman Sutton strongly suggested that a cost estimate to tie-in to the new sewer line should be 
obtained, because the residents in the proposed area will be required to connect to the sewer system 
if the town provides the service. 
 
Mr. Ellis addressed the Board of the effect on the town’s property taxes, stating the amount expected 
to be lost is $12,000 (twelve thousand dollars). 
 
Alderman Hummel posed the question, is it possible for those in the proposed area, to opt to remain 
in the city without the town going to the expense of providing sewer services?   Attorney Minor stated 
that a 20-year annexed area not being provided city services is extremely unusual. There’s no legal 
issue, other than the town has no legal obligation to provide the service. 
 
Attorney Minor opined, it would be favorable for the town if:  

o A petition is filed, 
o A referendum held, 
o A referendum upholding the desire of those to remain in the town rather than being de- 

annexed. 
This would provide an additional layer, in that, they are acknowledging the fact that the    
fundamental service of sewer is not going to be provided. 

           
A motion was made by Alderman Sutton to approve the 1st reading of Ordinance 24-07, amending 
verbiage in Section 2 from Town of Rossville, to Town of Oakland.  Alderman Cates seconded the 
motion.  A roll-call vote resulted in three (3) voting YES and two (2) voting NO.  Voting in favor were 
Alderman Sutton, Alderman Cates and Vice Mayor Wiggins.  Opposing votes were Alderman Hummel 
and Alderman Fisher.  The motion to approve the 1st Reading of Ordinance 24-07 passed in a three to 
two vote. 

   
8. Adjournment 

      Motion made to adjourn by Alderman Cates. 
 
 

                      Date June 29, 2024 
 

      _________________________                 __________________________ 
H. Michael Brown, Mayor   K. Yvonne Bullard, Town Recorder 

 
 



 
Meeting Minutes, June 29, 2024 
Page 4 

 

 



 

1 

 

ORDINANCE 24-08  
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE TOWN OF OAKLAND CODE OF ORDINANCES 
SPECIFICALLY TOWN ORDINANCE 22-03 RELATED TO THE INTERNATIONAL 

ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE  

WHEREAS, by Ordinance 22-03, the Town of Oakland (the Town), has adopted by 
reference multiple international codes which includes the 2021 edition of the International Energy 
Conservation Code (IECC); and,  

 
WHEREAS, the Town is not authorized to adopt code requirements which are more rigorous 

than the code requirements of the State of Tennessee; and,  
 
WHEREAS, the State of Tennessee code requirements for Energy Conservation operates 

pursuant to the IECC 2018 Edition with local amendments; and,  
 
WHEREAS, the Town finds it necessary to amend Section 12-101 of the Town Code of 

Ordinances as amended by Town Ordinance 22-03 in order to delete the adoption of the 2021 Edition 
of the IECC and adopt by reference the 2018 Edition of said International Code with recited local 
amendments as more specifically set forth in the attached Exhibit “A” which is incorporated herein.  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN 
FOR THE TOWN OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE, AS FOLLOWS:  
 
 1. Section 12-101 of the Town of Oakland Code of Ordinances as amended by Town 
Ordinance 22-03 is hereby further amended in order to remove and delete the adoption of the IECC 
2021 Edition and in its place and stead is hereby adopted the 2018 IECC with local amendments, 
those amendments being attached hereto designated Exhibit “A” and incorporated herein by reference 
as allowed by TCA § 6-54-501 – 506.
 

2. That this Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon the passage of the 
second and final reading, the public welfare so requiring. 

 
Passed First Reading:       ________________________ 

Passed Second Reading:  __________________________ 

Passed and Adopted this    day of     , 2024. 

 
      
H. Michael Brown, Mayor 

ATTEST: 
 
 
_____________________________ 
K. Yvonne Bullard, Town Recorder 



 

Exhibit “A” 
 
Amend Section C101.1 Title. Remove the Bracket portion, so when amended it shall read: 
This code shall be known as the Energy Conservation Code of The Town of Oakland, TN, and shall be cited 
as such. It is referred to herein as “this code”, 
Amend Section R101.1 Remove the Bracket portion, so when amended it shall read: 
This code shall be known as the Energy Conservation Code of The Town of Oakland, TN, and shall be cited 
as such. It is referred to herein as “this code”, 

 2018 International Energy Conservation Code with local amendments. 
 Table 402.1.1 from the 2009 International Energy Conservation Code (Insulation and 

Fenestration Requirements by Component) 
  

Climate 
Zone 

Fenestration 
U-Factor b 

Skylight 
U-

Factor 
b 

Glazed 
Fenestration 

SHGCb,e 

Ceiling 
R-

Value 

Wood 
Frame 

Wall 
R-

Value 

Mass 
Wall 

R-
Value 

i 

Floor 
R-

Value 

Basement 
Wall R-
Value e 

Slab 
R- 

Value 
and 

Depth 
d 

Crawl 
Space 
Wall 

R-
Value 

c 

3 0.5 0.65 0.3 0.3 0.13  5/8 19   5/13 0   5/13 
  

a. R-values are minimums. U-factors and SHGC are maximums. R-19 batts compressed into a 
nominal 2 x 6 framing cavity such that the R-value is reduced by R-1 or more shall be marked 
with the compressed batt R-value in addition to the full thickness R-value. 

b. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed 
fenestration. 

c. “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-
19 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met 
with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous insulated 
sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insulated 
sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the 
basement wall. 

d. R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs. Insulation depth shall be 
the depth of the footing or 2 feet, whichever is less in Zones 1 through 3 for heated slabs. 

e. There are no SHGC requirements in the Marine Zone. 
f. Basement wall insulation is not required in warm-humid locations as defined by Figure 301.1 

and Table 301.1 
g. Or insulation sufficient to fill the framing cavity, R-19 minimum. 
h. “13+5” means R-13 cavity insulation plus R-5 insulated sheathing. If structural sheathing covers 

25 percent or less of the exterior, insulation sheathing is not required where structural 
sheathing is used. If structural sheathing covers more than 25 percent of exterior, structural 
sheathing shall be supplemented with insulated sheathing of at least R-2. 

i. The second R-value applies when more than half the insulation is on the interior of the mass 
wall. 

j. For impact rated fenestration complying with Section R301.2.1.2 of the International Residential 
Code or Section 1609.1.2 of the International Building Code, the maximum U-factor shall be 0.75 
in Zone 2 and 0.65 in Zone 3. 

 



 
*Unless otherwise provided by applicable law or the provisions of this chapter, the required minimum 
codes and standards for the construction of one (1) and two (2) family dwellings, townhouses, and 
additions thereto of thirty (30) square feet or more of interior space in the State of Tennessee shall be 
those prescribed in the following publications: 
 

(a) International Residential Code (IRC), 2018 edition, published by the International Code 
Council, Inc. (ICC), 500 New Jersey Avenue Northwest, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C., 20001 
and Appendix Q except that: 

5. Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing is replaced with Section N1102.4.2.1 Testing Option 
and Section N1102.4.2.2 Visual Inspection form 2009 IRC. 
 
6. Section N1103.3.3 (R403.3.3) Duct Testing (Mandatory) and Section N1103.3.4 (R403.3.4) 
Duct Leakage (Prescriptive) are optional. 
 
7.Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) Insulation and Fenestration Requirement by Component and Table 
N1102.1.4 (R402.1.4) Equivalent U-Factors from 2018 IRC are replaced with Table N1102.1 
Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component and Table N1102.1.2 Equivalent U-
Factor from 2009 IRC. 
 
8. Section N1102.4.4 (R402.4.4) Rooms Containing Fuel-Burning Appliances is deleted in its 
entirety. 
 
9. Table N1102.1 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component in the 2009 edition is 
adopted and amended by adding the following as footnoted “I”: “Log walls complying with 
ICC400 and with a minimum average wall thickness of 5” or greater shall be permitted in Zone 3 
when a Fenestration U-Factor of .50 or lower is used, a Skylight U-Factor of .65 or lower is used, 
a Glazed Fenestration SHGC of .30 or lower is used, a 90 AFUE Furnace is used, an 85 AFUE 
Boiler is used, and a 9.0 HSPF Heat Pump (heating) and 15 SEER (cooling) are used.” 
 
10. Table N1102.1 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component in the 2009 edition 
is adopted and amended by adding the following as footnote “m”: “Log walls complying with 
ICC400 and with a minimum average wall thickness of 5’’ of greater shall be permitted in Zone 4 
when a Fenestration U-Factor or .35 or lower is used, a Skylight U-Factor of .60 or lower is used, 
a 90 AFUE Furnace is used, an 85 AFUE Boiler is used, and a 9.0 HSPF Heat Pump (heating) and 
15 SEER (cooling) are used.” 

(b) International Energy Conservation Code (IECC), 2018 edition, published by the ICC, except that: 
 

1.Section R402.4.1.2 Testing is deleted and replaced with Section 402.4.2.1 Testing Option and      
Section 402.4.2.2 Visual Inspection Option form 2009 IECC. 
  
2.Section R403.3.3 Duct Testing (Mandatory) and Section R403.3.4 Duct Leakage (Prescriptive) 
are optional. 
 
3.Table 402.1.2 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component and Table R402.1.4 
Equivalent U-Factors are deleted and replaced with Table 402.1.1 Insulation and Fenestration 
Requirements by Component and Table 402.1.3 Equivalent U-Factors 2009 IECC. 



 
(2) Paragraph (1) of this rule shall not be construed as adopting any provision of the cited publications 
which established: 
 (a) Any provisions superseded by law; 
 (b) An optional or recommended, rather than mandatory, standard or practice; or 

 (c) Any agency, procedure, fees or penalties for administration or enforcement purposes            
inconsistent with these rules. 
 

(3) The provisions of the cited publication adopted by reference in paragraph (1) shall govern the 
manner in which; 
 

(a) The codes and standards are applied to the construction of one (1) and two (2) family 
dwellings, townhouses, and additions thereto of thirty (30) or more square feet of interior 
space as defined in this chapter; 

(b)  Occupancies and types of construction are classified for the purpose of determining 
minimum requirements of the codes and standards; and  

(c) The Specific requirement of the codes and standards may be modified to permit the use of 
alternate materials or methods of construction. 

 



 

 

RESOLUTION 24-50 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE TO AUTHORIZE 
BIDDING FOR STREET IMPROVEMENTS 

 
WHEREAS, the Town of Oakland has numerous streets located within the public right of way for 
which it is responsible; and, 
 
WHEREAS, the Town has determined the need to resurface various streets within the Town; 
and, 
 
WHEREAS, funds are available in the adopted Fiscal Year 2025 Annual Budget. 
 
NOW, THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN OF THE TOWN 
OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE: 
 
SECTION 1. The Town staff, in conjuncƟon with the Town Engineer, is authorized to prepare bid 
documents for resurfacing of various streets.  The bid shall be for labor and materials to 
complete the necessary work related to Roadway Improvements 2025. 
 
SECTION 2. That these bids when received shall be reviewed and evaluated by the Board of 
Mayor and Aldermen based upon funding allocated in the Fiscal Year 25 Budget. 
 
____ made a moƟon to approve ResoluƟon 24-50.  ________seconded the moƟon.  __ in favor, 
___opposed. ResoluƟon 24-50 ___.   
 
PASSED AND ADOPTED this day of ___ day of ___ 2024. 
             
        ___________________________ 
        H. Michael Brown, Mayor 
ATTEST: 
 
 
____________________________ 
K. Yvonne Bullard, Town Recorder 



        

 
 
 

 
Proposed 2024 Roadway Improvements 

 

 

Location Type of Work Estimated Cost 

Wirt Road Extended Full Depth Reclamation 198,656.20 

White Pine Place (Northwoods) Mill & Fill 69,261.60 

Clay Hills Section 1 Mill & Fill 34,384 

Country Place Street Mill & Fill 77,948 

Garden Springs Drive Mill & Fill 119,208 

A2H Engineering Contingency @ 10% 57,601 

A2H Engineering Engineering & Inspection 54,500 

Total   611,558.80 



 

 

RESOLUTION 24-51 

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING A PROFESSIONAL SERVICES AGREEMENT WITH 
A2H ENGINEERS ARCHITECTS PLANNERS 

 

WHEREAS, the Town of Oakland will accept bids for various Roadway Improvements 2025; and 

WHEREAS, it is desired and necessary for the Town to have in place a ConstrucƟon InspecƟon 
and AdministraƟon Agreement for these Roadway Improvements; and 

WHEREAS, A2H Engineers Architects Planners has previously served the Town as engineer and 
consultant.   

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN FOR THE 
TOWN OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE AS FOLLOWS: 

SECTION 1. That the Town Engineer professional services agreement for construcƟon inspecƟon 
and administraƟon for Roadway Improvements 2025, as aƩached hereto be accepted and 
approved. 

SECTION 2. That the Mayor be authorized and directed to execute this agreement on behalf of 
the Town. 

SECTION 3. That this contract amount be funded through the Fiscal Year 2025 Annual Budget. 

______ made a moƟon to ___ ResoluƟon 24-51.  _______ seconded the moƟon. __ in favor, ___ 
opposed.  ResoluƟon 24-51 ___. 

PASSED AND ADOPTED on this ___ day of July, 2024. 

 

       __________________________ 
       H. Michael Brown, Mayor 
 
ATTEST: 
 
 
_____________________________ 
K. Yvonne Bullard, Town Recorder 
















