
 

 

Town of Oakland 

Board of Mayor and Aldermen 

Regular Meeting 

Thursday, August 15, 2024 

7:00 P.M. 

Town Hall Courtroom 

AGENDA 

 
I.  Call to Order 

 

II. Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance 

 

III.  Establish Quorum 

 

IV.  Approval of Agenda/ Additions or Deletions 

 

V. Approval of Minutes 

 

 July 18, 2024 – Regular Board Meeting Minutes 

 

VI. Special Item: 
  

VII. Citizen Comments 

“Open for any Oakland citizens to be heard on items and concerns.  Citizens are to be 

recognized by Chair and come to front of room before speaking.  Each speaker shall state 

their name and address for the record.  The Mayor and Board of Aldermen shall make no 

decision or consideration of action of citizen comments, except to refer to the Town 

Manager for administrative consideration or to schedule the matter for Mayor & Board 

of Aldermen consideration at a later date.  Speakers shall limit their comments to three 

(3) minutes unless allowed by Chair.  Speaker shall limit their comment to one (1) 

subject.” 
 

VIII. Comments from the Mayor 

 

IX.  Comments from the Aldermen 

 

 Vice Mayor Wiggins Aldermen Cates Aldermen Fisher  

 Aldermen Sutton Aldermen Hummel 

 

X. Consideration of Department Director Reports: 

 

 Police  Fire Finance  Recorder  Water Wastewater Public Works 

 Building and Codes Planning & Development Parks & Rec 



 

 

 

XI.  Town Manager’s Report 

  

XII. Old Business: Ordinances Second and Final Reading 
 

A. Ordinance 24-08 Amending Municipal Code Title 12 International Energy Conservation Code 

 

XIV. New Business: Ordinances on First Reading – Public Hearing 

  

OPEN ___________                CLOSED ___________ 

 

A.  Ordinance 24-09 Amending the Text of the Municipal Zoning Ordinance of the Town of 

Oakland to Amend ARTICLE III, SECTION 3.20  

 

XV. Consideration of Resolutions:  Old Business  

  

XVI. Consideration of Resolutions:  New Business 

A. Resolution 24-52 – SCADA Project – Request for Bids Water Depart. 

XVII. Other Items of Business Items  

 

A. Discussion – Live Stream Audio Options 
 

B. Discussion - Outsourcing Water Billing 
 

C. Discussion – TCA 2-7-143  / Ordinance 15-5 Governing Signs 
 

D. Kroger Company Design Review Appeal 
 

E. Establish Work-Session – Monday, August 26, 2024 @ 6pm 
 

XVIII. Approval of Invoices 

 

XIX. Motion to Adjourn 



 

 

Mayor & Board of Aldermen – Regular Meeting 

Meeting Minutes 

July 18, 2024 

Present: Mayor Michael Brown 

 Vice Mayor Wiggins, Aldermen Cates, Fisher, Hummel & Sutton 

  

Prayer and Pledge of Allegiance to the American Flag 

  

  

1. Call to order by Mayor Brown 

2. Prayer & Pledge of Allegiance to the American Flag  

3. Establish Quorum   

All present 

4.  Approval of Agenda   

Town Manager Ellis requested an agenda change to “XVI B & C” to reflect the 2 resolution 

headings; remove “2024 and add FY24-25” Roadway Improvements.   

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the agenda as amended.  Alderman 

Sutton seconded the motion.  All were in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed. 

5. Reading and Correction/Approval of Minutes of Regular Board  

 

June 20, 2024 – Regular Board Meeting Minutes  

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the June 20, 2024 Regular Board Meeting 

Minutes. Alderman Cates seconded the motion.  All were in favor, none opposed.  The 

motion passed.  

June 29, 2024 – Special Call Board Meeting Minutes  

Alderman Fisher made a motion to approve June 29, 2024 Special Call Meeting Minutes.  

Alderman Hummel seconded the motion.  All were in favor, none opposed.  The motion 

passed. 

6. Special Item: 

        None. 

7. Citizen’s Comments  

None. 

8.   Communications from the Mayor  



Meeting Minutes, July 18, 2024 

Page 2 

 

Mayor Brown stated he had received a complaint related to a pothole, located near Oakland 

Tire and Hwy 64.  Mayor Brown requested that Public Director Dennis Mullins report his 

findings.  Mr. Mullins confirmed the pothole is located at the north end of Pierce Road, which 

is in the state right-of-way and is not the Town of Oakland’s responsibility.  Mr. Mullins also 

commented, the state was contacted about the pothole issue.   

Mayor Brown commented on a 2023 property tax comparison of municipalities near Oakland.  

Referencing the property tax amount of a home valued at $429,950 in unincorporated Shelby 

County, Arlington, Bartlett, Lakeland and Memphis, compared to paying taxes on the same 

home in Oakland.  Memphis was the highest at $6,457 and Oakland the lowest at $2,070.  

In pointing out the variances in the property taxes, he reiterated a past comment, that a 

future property taxes increase is inevitable and necessary to provide the needs  of the town 

and services to its citizens. 

9. Communication from the Aldermen  

Vice Mayor Wiggins expressed thanks to everyone involved for another successful Fourth of 

July Fireworks Celebration in Oakland. 

Alderman Fisher reminded everyone that a local election is taking place and expressed the 

need of getting the word out to vote. 

Alderman Hummel stated the fireworks display was wonderful and commended the Police 

Department in their efforts in relieving traffic issues related to the event.  Alderman Hummel 

reiterated Alderman Fisher’s comments in getting the word out to vote.   

Alderman Cates inquired of the rules in signs being placed on state right-of-way.  Attorney 

Minor stated the state has authority over the state-right-of ways and the right to remove 

signs.  Town Manager Ellis said he would further investigate the issue. 

Alderman Sutton called for a moment of silence in remembrance of Cory Comperatore, the 

retired fire chief who was murdered during the assassination attempt on the former 

president, Donald Trump. 

10.  Department Head Reports  

Waste-water Director Coker provided a brief update on the waste-water project.  The 

contractor has made progress with the concrete pours, with more to come in weeks ahead.  

He encouraged those interested to contact him for an on-site visit.  He reported the 

contractor has been very good to work with and is committed in producing a good product 

for Oakland. 

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins, referring to Director Coker’s monthly report, asked Mr. Coker if there 

are any concerns or consequences in Oakland pumping more than 1 million gallons a day, 

citing numbers of 1.1m and 1.3 m.  Director Coker explained the state determines excessive 



Meeting Minutes, July 18, 2024 

Page 3 

 

violations, not necessarily by volume, but on the number of times the state permit is violated.  

Director Coker commented his belief, we would be fine until the completion of the plant.   

 

Alderman Hummel remarked on the excellent report provided by Water Director Armstrong, 

in response to a citizen’s concern (last month) of fluoride in the towns water supply.  She 

addressed Director Armstrong of possibly going through the procedure of having it removed 

and requested a workshop to address the cost and allow the citizens to voice their opinion. 

 

Alderman Cates expressed concern of the increased number of “No Driver’s License” 

offences.  

 

Alderman Fisher inquired of impounding vehicles.  Police Chief Earl explained that vehicles 

are impounded for violations related to drugs, revoked DUI, things of that nature, but not for 

the violation of No Driver’s License. 

 

Alderman Sutton requested Fire Chief Walls to comment on the fire hazard related to lithium 

batteries.  Chief Walls noted most of the fire calls in his department are garage fire related, 

recommending heat detectors as a means of fire protection in such instances. 

11.  Town Manager Report 

Town Manager Ellis provided a progress update on the park complex project.  He stated the 

drainage survey is in progress, once that’s done, the civil drawings will get underway , with 

the final plans expected in 4-6 weeks after the civil drawings have been completed.  

12.    Old Business: Ordinances Second and Final Reading 

 None 

13.   New Business: Ordinances First Reading 

 

A. Ordinance 24-08 Amending Municipal Code Title 12 International Energy Conservation 

Code 

 

Alderman Fisher made a motion to hear Ordinance 24-08.  Vice Mayor Wiggins seconded the 

motion to hear. 

Alderman Cates made a motion to approve the 1st Reading of Ordinance 24-08.  Alderman 

Hummel (Rounds) seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion passed.  

      

      14.  Consideration of Resolutions:  Old Business 

 

None  

 

  

 

 

 



Meeting Minutes, July 18, 2024 

Page 4 

 

 15.  Consideration of Resolutions:  New Business 

 

A.  Road Paving Priority List 

Town Manager Ellis presented the Board with a list of Proposed 2024 Roadway 

Improvements indicating road names, type of work and estimated cost of each.  He and 

Public Works Director Mullins prepared the list, recommending the work to be done.  The 

list is comprised of five (5) roads, plus the engineering cost, totaling $611,558.80. 

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins opposed Wirt Road Extended.  He acknowledged it should be fixed, but 

the burden should not fall on the Oakland taxpayers.  

 

Alderman Sutton proposed that administration should attempt to schedule a meeting with 

Fayette County, to ask for assistance in the repair of Wirt Road.  Fayette County has 

ownership of Wirt Road up to Hwy 194.  He emphasized Tomlin Road was another that 

Fayette County should share responsibility. 

 

After further discussion it was determined, it would be beneficial to everyone to invite 

Fayette County Officials to a scheduled workshop, proposing that Oakland take-in Wirt Road 

if Fayette County makes the repairs.   

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to remove Wirt Road Extended from the proposed list, 

allowing Town Manager Ellis to revise the list with other roads identified as needing repair.  

The revised list shall not exceed $611,558.80.  Alderman Hummel (Rounds) seconded the 

motion.  Four (4) in favor, one (1) opposed.  Alderman Fisher cast the opposing vote.  The 

motion passed. 

 

B.  Resolution 24-50 Authorizing the Solicitation of Bids for 24-25 Roadway Improvements  

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   

 

Alderman Sutton made a motion to approve Resolution 24-50, in accordance with the 

revised road list, and it being provided to the Board members for review.  Alderman Cates 

seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-50 passed.   

 

C.  Resolution 24-51 Authorizing A Professional Services Agreement for 2024 Roadway   

Improvements 

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to hear.   

 

Alderman Fisher made a motion to approve Resolution 24-51.  Alderman Sutton seconded 

the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  Resolution 24-51 passed.   

 

 

 

 

 

 



Meeting Minutes, July 18, 2024 

Page 5 

 

              16.  Other Items of Business 

              

A.  Appointment of Finance Director  

       

Town Manager Ellis presented Ms. Lorie Rice as his recommendation to fill the vacant 

position of Finance Director for the Town of Oakland. 

 

Vice Mayor Wiggins made a motion to approve the hiring of Ms. Lorie Rice as Finance 

Director.  Alderman Cates seconded the motion.  All in favor, none opposed.  The motion 

passed.   

 

B.   Establish Time and Date of Work-Session 

 

Town Manager Ellis was tasked with contacting Fayette County for a date and time 

convenient for them to attend to discuss Wirt Road.  Other topics for the workshop will 

include Industrial Development Board and Flouridation of the towns water supply.  

 

 15.   Approval of Invoices  

None  

 

              16. Meeting Adjourned  

              Alderman Cates made a motion to adjourn the meeting.  

                                                        Date: July 18, 2024 

 

 

         __________________________  __________________________ 

        H. Michael Brown, Mayor   K. Yvonne Bullard, City Recorder   



 

1 

 

ORDINANCE 24-08  
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE TOWN OF OAKLAND CODE OF ORDINANCES 

SPECIFICALLY TOWN ORDINANCE 22-03 RELATED TO THE INTERNATIONAL 

ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE  

WHEREAS, by Ordinance 22-03, the Town of Oakland (the Town), has adopted by 

reference multiple international codes which includes the 2021 edition of the International Energy 

Conservation Code (IECC); and,  

 
WHEREAS, the Town is not authorized to adopt code requirements which are more rigorous 

than the code requirements of the State of Tennessee; and,  
 
WHEREAS, the State of Tennessee code requirements for Energy Conservation operates 

pursuant to the IECC 2018 Edition with local amendments; and,  

 
WHEREAS, the Town finds it necessary to amend Section 12-101 of the Town Code of 

Ordinances as amended by Town Ordinance 22-03 in order to delete the adoption of the 2021 Edition 
of the IECC and adopt by reference the 2018 Edition of said International Code with recited local 
amendments as more specifically set forth in the attached Exhibit “A” which is incorporated herein.  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN 
FOR THE TOWN OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE, AS FOLLOWS:  

 

 1. Section 12-101 of the Town of Oakland Code of Ordinances as amended by Town 

Ordinance 22-03 is hereby further amended in order to remove and delete the adoption of the IECC 

2021 Edition and in its place and stead is hereby adopted the 2018 IECC with local amendments, 

those amendments being attached hereto designated Exhibit “A” and incorporated herein by reference 

as allowed by TCA § 6-54-501 – 506.
 

2. That this Ordinance shall become effective immediately upon the passage of the 

second and final reading, the public welfare so requiring. 

 

Passed First Reading:       July 25, 2024 

Passed Second Reading:  __________________________ 

Passed and Adopted this    day of     , 2024. 

 

      

H. Michael Brown, Mayor 

ATTEST: 

 

 

_____________________________ 

K. Yvonne Bullard, Town Recorder 



 

Exhibit “A” 
 

Amend Section C101.1 Title. Remove the Bracket portion, so when amended it shall read: 

This code shall be known as the Energy Conservation Code of The Town of Oakland, TN, and shall be cited 

as such. It is referred to herein as “this code”, 

Amend Section R101.1 Remove the Bracket portion, so when amended it shall read: 

This code shall be known as the Energy Conservation Code of The Town of Oakland, TN, and shall be cited 

as such. It is referred to herein as “this code”, 

• 2018 International Energy Conservation Code with local amendments. 

• Table 402.1.1 from the 2009 International Energy Conservation Code (Insulation and 

Fenestration Requirements by Component) 

  

Climate 
Zone 

Fenestration 
U-Factor b 

Skylight 
U-

Factor 
b 

Glazed 
Fenestration 

SHGCb,e 

Ceiling 
R-

Value 

Wood 
Frame 
Wall 

R-
Value 

Mass 
Wall 

R-
Value 

i 

Floor 
R-

Value 

Basement 
Wall R-
Value e 

Slab 
R- 

Value 
and 

Depth 
d 

Crawl 
Space 
Wall 

R-
Value 

c 

3 0.5 0.65 0.3 0.3 0.13  5/8 19   5/13 0   5/13 

  

a. R-values are minimums. U-factors and SHGC are maximums. R-19 batts compressed into a 

nominal 2 x 6 framing cavity such that the R-value is reduced by R-1 or more shall be marked 

with the compressed batt R-value in addition to the full thickness R-value. 

b. The fenestration U-factor column excludes skylights. The SHGC column applies to all glazed 

fenestration. 

c. “15/19” means R-15 continuous insulated sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-

19 cavity insulation at the interior of the basement wall. “15/19” shall be permitted to be met 

with R-13 cavity insulation on the interior of the basement wall plus R-5 continuous insulated 

sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home. “10/13” means R-10 continuous insulated 

sheathing on the interior or exterior of the home or R-13 cavity insulation at the interior of the 

basement wall. 

d. R-5 shall be added to the required slab edge R-values for heated slabs. Insulation depth shall be 

the depth of the footing or 2 feet, whichever is less in Zones 1 through 3 for heated slabs. 

e. There are no SHGC requirements in the Marine Zone. 

f. Basement wall insulation is not required in warm-humid locations as defined by Figure 301.1 

and Table 301.1 

g. Or insulation sufficient to fill the framing cavity, R-19 minimum. 

h. “13+5” means R-13 cavity insulation plus R-5 insulated sheathing. If structural sheathing covers 

25 percent or less of the exterior, insulation sheathing is not required where structural 

sheathing is used. If structural sheathing covers more than 25 percent of exterior, structural 

sheathing shall be supplemented with insulated sheathing of at least R-2. 

i. The second R-value applies when more than half the insulation is on the interior of the mass 

wall. 

j. For impact rated fenestration complying with Section R301.2.1.2 of the International Residential 

Code or Section 1609.1.2 of the International Building Code, the maximum U-factor shall be 0.75 

in Zone 2 and 0.65 in Zone 3. 

 



 

*Unless otherwise provided by applicable law or the provisions of this chapter, the required minimum 

codes and standards for the construction of one (1) and two (2) family dwellings, townhouses, and 

additions thereto of thirty (30) square feet or more of interior space in the State of Tennessee shall be 

those prescribed in the following publications: 

 

(a) International Residential Code (IRC), 2018 edition, published by the International Code 

Council, Inc. (ICC), 500 New Jersey Avenue Northwest, 6th Floor, Washington, D.C., 20001 

and Appendix Q except that: 

5. Section N1102.4.1.2 (R402.4.1.2) Testing is replaced with Section N1102.4.2.1 Testing Option 

and Section N1102.4.2.2 Visual Inspection form 2009 IRC. 

 

6. Section N1103.3.3 (R403.3.3) Duct Testing (Mandatory) and Section N1103.3.4 (R403.3.4) 

Duct Leakage (Prescriptive) are optional. 

 

7.Table N1102.1.2 (R402.1.2) Insulation and Fenestration Requirement by Component and Table 

N1102.1.4 (R402.1.4) Equivalent U-Factors from 2018 IRC are replaced with Table N1102.1 

Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component and Table N1102.1.2 Equivalent U-

Factor from 2009 IRC. 

 

8. Section N1102.4.4 (R402.4.4) Rooms Containing Fuel-Burning Appliances is deleted in its 

entirety. 

 

9. Table N1102.1 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component in the 2009 edition is 

adopted and amended by adding the following as footnoted “I”: “Log walls complying with 

ICC400 and with a minimum average wall thickness of 5” or greater shall be permitted in Zone 3 

when a Fenestration U-Factor of .50 or lower is used, a Skylight U-Factor of .65 or lower is used, 

a Glazed Fenestration SHGC of .30 or lower is used, a 90 AFUE Furnace is used, an 85 AFUE 

Boiler is used, and a 9.0 HSPF Heat Pump (heating) and 15 SEER (cooling) are used.” 

 

10. Table N1102.1 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component in the 2009 edition 

is adopted and amended by adding the following as footnote “m”: “Log walls complying with 

ICC400 and with a minimum average wall thickness of 5’’ of greater shall be permitted in Zone 4 

when a Fenestration U-Factor or .35 or lower is used, a Skylight U-Factor of .60 or lower is used, 

a 90 AFUE Furnace is used, an 85 AFUE Boiler is used, and a 9.0 HSPF Heat Pump (heating) and 

15 SEER (cooling) are used.” 

(b) International Energy Conservation Code (IECC), 2018 edition, published by the ICC, except that: 

 

1.Section R402.4.1.2 Testing is deleted and replaced with Section 402.4.2.1 Testing Option and      

Section 402.4.2.2 Visual Inspection Option form 2009 IECC. 

  

2.Section R403.3.3 Duct Testing (Mandatory) and Section R403.3.4 Duct Leakage (Prescriptive) 

are optional. 

 

3.Table 402.1.2 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component and Table R402.1.4 

Equivalent U-Factors are deleted and replaced with Table 402.1.1 Insulation and Fenestration 

Requirements by Component and Table 402.1.3 Equivalent U-Factors 2009 IECC. 



 

(2) Paragraph (1) of this rule shall not be construed as adopting any provision of the cited publications 

which established: 

 (a) Any provisions superseded by law; 

 (b) An optional or recommended, rather than mandatory, standard or practice; or 

 (c) Any agency, procedure, fees or penalties for administration or enforcement purposes            

inconsistent with these rules. 

 

(3) The provisions of the cited publication adopted by reference in paragraph (1) shall govern the 

manner in which; 

 

(a) The codes and standards are applied to the construction of one (1) and two (2) family 

dwellings, townhouses, and additions thereto of thirty (30) or more square feet of interior 

space as defined in this chapter; 

(b)  Occupancies and types of construction are classified for the purpose of determining 

minimum requirements of the codes and standards; and  

(c) The Specific requirement of the codes and standards may be modified to permit the use of 

alternate materials or methods of construction. 

 



 

 

 ORDINANCE #24-09 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE TEXT OF THE MUNICIPLE ZONING ORDINANCE OF THE 

TOWN OF OAKLAND TO AMEND ARTICLE III, SECTION 3.20 TO ALLOW A FENCE TO 

ENCROACHMENT NO MORE THAN TEN FEET FROM THE CORNER OF THE RESIDENCE 

BEYOND THE FRONT YARD SETBACK LINE TOWARD THE ROAD  

 

WHEREAS, Section 13-7-201 through 13-7-211 of the Tennessee Code Annotated empowered the 

Town of Oakland to enact the Oakland Municipal Zoning Ordinance and provide for its administration 

and enforcement; and,    

 

WHEREAS, the Board of Mayor and Aldermen deem it necessary, for the purpose of promoting the 

health, safety, morals and general welfare of the Town to amend said Ordinance; and, 

 

WHEREAS, the Oakland Municipal Planning Commission has reviewed said proposed amendment 

pursuant to Section 13-7-201 of the Tennessee Code Annotated and recommends such amendment 

to the Oakland Board of Mayor and Aldermen; and 

 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Tennessee Code Annotated, Section 13-7-203 a public hearing was held on 

August 15, 2024 before this body of which the time and place was published with at least (15) days 

advanced notice in a newspaper of general circulation. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Town of Oakland Tennessee that the Oakland Municipal 

Zoning Ordinance be amended as follows: 

 

Section 1. That Article III, GENERAL PROVISIONS, Section 3.20 Fences and Walls be amended by the 

deletion of the first paragraph and the addition of the following new paragraph: 

 

Notwithstanding other provisions of this Ordinance, fences and walls shall not be permitted in any 

required front yard as established in this Zoning Ordinance, with the exception that a fence may 

encroach within one of the two front yard setbacks up to but not more than 10 feet notwithstanding 

any underlying zoning district front yard setback regulation, provided further that no fence shall be 

permitted within any designated easement area.  The front yards for corner lots shall be established 

for each yard adjacent to a street (see also Yards in Article II). 

 

SECTION 2. BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED that this Ordinance shall become effective immediately 

upon its adoption, THE PUBLIC WELFARE REQUIRING IT. 

 

 

1st Reading ______________________ 

 

 

2nd Reading ______________________ 

 

____________________________ 

      H. Michael Brown, Mayor 

ATTEST:  _______________________________ 

                 K. Yvonne Bullard, Town Recorder 





 

 

RESOLUTION 24-52 
 
 

A RESOLUTION OF THE TOWN OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE  
AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO ISSUE REQUEST FOR PROPOSALS FOR 

SCADA SYSTEM PROJECT 
 

WHEREAS, the efficient operations of the Town of Oakland Water Department rely heavily on 
Supervisory Control and Data Acquisition (SCADA); and  
 
WHEREAS, the SCADA system controls the water equipment, monitors the conditions of its 
plants (locally and remotely), and compiles real time data, which detect and communicate 
system issues to alleviate downtime; and, 
  

WHEREAS, the SCADA system hardware and software currently in place is outdated and is 

therefore in immediate need of a system upgrade. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF MAYOR AND ALDERMEN OF THE 
TOWN OF OAKLAND, TENNESSEE AS FOLLOWS:   
 
That the Mayor of the Town of Oakland is hereby authorized to issue a request for proposals for 

a SCADA System upgrade, necessary to ensure efficiency and reliable water functionality.   

 

THIS RESOLUTION TAKES EFFECT UPON ITS PASSAGE this ___ day of _____, 2024 
 
A motion was made by _____ that the foregoing resolution be adopted.  The motion was 
seconded by _____.  The motion passed unanimously.   
 
The Mayor declared the Resolution duly adopted and effective from and after this __ day of 
_____, 2024. 
 
Done by order of the Board of Mayor and Aldermen of the Town of Oakland, Tennessee this __ 
day of _____, 2024. 
 
 
 

______________________________           
         H. Michael Brown, Mayor 

ATTEST: 
 
_________________________________ 
K. Yvonne Bullard, City Recorder 



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

P R O P O S A L  
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

Town of Oakland 

AV Quote w Full DSP 
 
 
 
 
 

DATE 
 

Wednesday, 07 August 2024  
 
 
 

 

PREPARED BY 
 

David Perry 

Design Consultant



 

 

 

Scope of Work 

 

Proposal Number: J24030218  

Proposal Date: 8/7/2024 

 

 

Prepared for: Town of Oakland 

Attn: Heather Craig Prepared by: David Perry 

Phone: 901-465-8523 Phone: 901-308-4299 

Email: hcraig@oaklandtn.gov  Email: David.Perry@cti.com 

  

 

 
 

 
Both proposals include a wireless mic system (WLM). The WLM includes a handheld 
wireless transmitter with the famous SM58 mic capsule, a single channel receiver, dual 
charging station, two sb900 rechargeable batteries, and a standard desktop mic stand. To 
achieve a balance between coverage and installation impact, the wireless receiver will be 
set up on top of the existing audio rack. 
 
 
The second proposal will include a larger 12x8 Digital Sound Processor, noted as “WLM 
and Full DSP”. This DSP will replace the existing mixer and mix all mic inputs and make the 
appropriate distributions. In addition to a single device for all mixing, the Full DSP can be 
connected with the meeting laptop so all microphones can be used in a Zoom or Teams 
call. Volume Levels and Signal Routing will be set digitally and will not be mistakenly 
lowered. 

 
 
  

Ship to: Town of Oakland 
     170 Doss Circle 
     Oakland, TN 
      

Bill to: Town of Oakland 
 170 Doss Circle 
 Oakland, TN 
  

mailto:name@email.com
mailto:name@email.com


 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  2 

 

Your Investment 
 
Below is the cost of this solution based on the outlined scope of work. If you have 
questions about the complete solution, please let us know how we can help align this 
investment with additional needs or changes in scope. 

 

Proposal Summary    

Description Price 

Equipment $4,406.84  

Implementation Services $3,784.01    

Subtotal $8,190.85  

Tax Exempt 

Grand Total $8,190.85 
 

 
 

Recommended  
Description Price 

2 Additional Years CTI Complete Service Agreement $701.98 

4 Additional Years CTI Complete Service Agreement $1,403.95 

 
 
 

Down Payment Requirements 
Down payment of 60% required to initiate order.



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  3 

 

Why Us? 
 
 
 
 

Our CTI Complete service is there for you 24/7 through our dedicated CTI Care 

customer experience team. Through on-site technical service, recommended 

programming upgrades, and quarterly reliability checks, your system is covered for the 

unexpected, as well as planned maintenance. Your teams will be trained to operate 

equipment with confidence. When critical meetings arise, we help ensure system 

performance with proactive system testing and an on-site checklist, so your systems will 

be ready when it matters most. Our managed services staff does more than diagnose 

and repair failures, they help plan for system life cycles. 

                    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

  



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  4 

 

Bill of Materials 
WLM and Full DSP 

 

Manufacturer  P/N  Description  Qty  Unit Price  Ext. Price  

 General: $4,406.84 
 

Shure  SB900B  
RECHARGEABLE 

BATTERY  
2  $95.00  $190.00  

 

Atlas  DS5E  
Fixed Height Desktop Mic 
Stand 5 inch Ebony Finish  

1  $20.65  $20.65  
 

Shure  QLXD4=-G50  
Half-Rack, Single Channel 

Receiver  
1  $662.56  $662.56  

 

Shure  SBC200-US  
Dual Docking Charger with 

PS45US Power Supply  
1  $218.50  $218.50  

 

Biamp  911.0399.900  ParleTesiraFORTECI  1  $2,545.00  $2,545.00  
 

Inogeni  U-BRIDGE  
Inogeni U-BRIDGE USB 2.0 

EXTENDERS  
1  $360.44  $360.44  

 

Shure  WA371  
Mic Clip for all Handheld 

Transmitters  
1  $7.13  $7.13  

 

Shure  
QLXD2/SM58

=-G50  
Handheld Transmitter with 

SM58Â® Microphone  
1  $402.56  $402.56  

 

  

  



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  5 

 

Standard Disclaimer 
 

CTI provides for twelve (12) months of CTI Complete on all system purchases. CTI warrants the 
system implemented is free from defects in material and workmanship, in accordance with the 
contract, drawings, specifications, alterations and additions thereto, for a period of twelve (12) 
months from the date of commencement of use, substantial completion, or date of notice of 
completion, whichever occurs first. This coverage does not protect against consumables, severe 
weather, and acts of God. 
 

Terms 
Terms are NET 30 with approved credit. For orders that exceed ten thousand dollars; 60% to 
initiate order, 30% upon substantial completion, and 10% upon completion, or progress billing 
based on purchase agreement at time of order. Payments made by credit card are subject to a 
3.0% fee. 
 
All applicable taxes are the responsibility of the purchaser and will be added to the final invoice. 
Any cancelled orders or returns are subject to manufacturer acceptance; shipping and restocking 
fees may apply. This proposal is valid for fourteen (14) days.  

 
Installation Description and Requirements 
Provided by CTI: If installation is purchased, CTI will install all A/V components. CTI will also 
perform all programming, alignments, and end-user training. CTI will provide A/V project 
management, and provide drawings as required. This install price assumes a Monday through 
Friday 8:00am to 5:00pm install time. Room availability must be in consecutive 8-hour blocks. 
Any required changes or rushes may affect the final price.  

 
Provided by Others 
Electrical requirements are to be provided by others unless specifically included in CTI Scope of 
Work.  
 

Statement 
This system proposal is the property of CTI and is delivered with the sole intent of being viewed 
by management of Town of Oakland for evaluation purposes only. This proposal or any part of 
this proposal is not to be presented to, or viewed by any other party, vendor, or CTI competitor 
without the written consent of CTI Any effort to do so will be considered a violation of copyright 
law. 
  



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  6 

 

Next Steps 
 

1. Upon Notice to Proceed, CTI will begin executing the project plan with an internal handoff of 
the project to our operations team. 

 
2. If you have questions about the process as we move forward, please contact me at 

David.Perry@cti.com or 901-308-4299. 
 

3. You will be contacted by a CTI Project Manager to schedule a project kickoff meeting to 
review the project scope and schedule. 

 

Total 

J24030218 - $8,190.85 

 
 
 

Customer Signature 
 
 

 CTI Signature 

Printed Name 
 
 

 Printed Name 

Title 
 
 

 Title 

Date 
 

 Date 

 

 
 



 
 

 
 

 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

P R O P O S A L  
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

Town of Oakland 

AV Quote w/ Small DSP 
 
 
 
 
 

DATE 
 

Wednesday, 07 August 2024  
 
 
 

 

PREPARED BY 
 

David Perry 

Design Consultant



 

 

 

Scope of Work 

 

Proposal Number: J24030218  

Proposal Date: 8/7/2024 

 

 

Prepared for: Town of Oakland 

Attn: Heather Craig Prepared by: David Perry 

Phone: 901-465-8523 Phone: 901-308-4299 

Email: hcraig@oaklandtn.gov  Email: David.Perry@cti.com 

  

 

 
 

Both proposals include a wireless mic system (WLM). The WLM includes a handheld 
wireless transmitter with the famous SM58 mic capsule, a single channel receiver, dual 
charging station, two sb900 rechargeable batteries, and a standard desktop mic stand. To 
achieve a balance between coverage and installation impact, the wireless receiver will be 
set up on top of the existing audio rack. 
 
 
The first proposal will include a 4x4 analog Digital Sound Processor, noted as “WLM and 
Small DSP”. The 4x4 will perform two functions: 1) to premix three mics to the existing 
mixer, and 2) to distribute an audio post-mix to the Streaming Device and Amplifier 
separately. This proposal will not impact the functions of the meeting laptop. 

 
 
 
  

Ship to: Town of Oakland 
     170 Doss Circle 
     Oakland, TN 
      

Bill to: Town of Oakland 
 170 Doss Circle 
 Oakland, TN 
  

mailto:name@email.com
mailto:name@email.com


 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  2 

 

Your Investment 
 
Below is the cost of this solution based on the outlined scope of work. If you have 
questions about the complete solution, please let us know how we can help align this 
investment with additional needs or changes in scope. 

 

Proposal Summary    

Description Price 

Equipment $2,120.15  

Implementation Services $2,794.03    

Subtotal $4,914.18  

Tax Exempt  

Grand Total $4,914.18 
 

 
 

Recommended  
Description Price 

2 Additional Years CTI Complete Service Agreement $423.70 

4 Additional Years CTI Complete Service Agreement $847.40 

 
 
 

Down Payment Requirements 
Down payment of 60% required to initiate order.



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  3 

 

Why Us? 
 
 
 
 

Our CTI Complete service is there for you 24/7 through our dedicated CTI Care 

customer experience team. Through on-site technical service, recommended 

programming upgrades, and quarterly reliability checks, your system is covered for the 

unexpected, as well as planned maintenance. Your teams will be trained to operate 

equipment with confidence. When critical meetings arise, we help ensure system 

performance with proactive system testing and an on-site checklist, so your systems will 

be ready when it matters most. Our managed services staff does more than diagnose 

and repair failures, they help plan for system life cycles. 

                    

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

  



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  4 

 

Bill of Materials 
WLM and Small DSP 

 

Manufacturer  P/N  Description  Qty  Unit Price  Ext. Price  

 General: $2,120.15 
 

Shure  SB900B  
RECHARGEABLE 

BATTERY  
2  $95.00  $190.00  

 

Extron  60-2041-01  DMP 44 xi - Audio DSP  1  $618.75  $618.75  
 

Atlas  DS5E  
Fixed Height Desktop Mic 
Stand 5 inch Ebony Finish  

1  $20.65  $20.65  
 

Shure  
QLXD2/SM58

=-G50  
Handheld Transmitter with 

SM58Â® Microphone  
1  $402.56  $402.56  

 

Shure  WA371  
Mic Clip for all Handheld 

Transmitters  
1  $7.13  $7.13  

 

Shure  SBC200-US  
Dual Docking Charger with 

PS45US Power Supply  
1  $218.50  $218.50  

 

Shure  QLXD4=-G50  
Half-Rack, Single Channel 

Receiver  
1  $662.56  $662.56  

 

  

  



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  5 

 

Standard Disclaimer 
 

CTI provides for twelve (12) months of CTI Complete on all system purchases. CTI warrants the 
system implemented is free from defects in material and workmanship, in accordance with the 
contract, drawings, specifications, alterations and additions thereto, for a period of twelve (12) 
months from the date of commencement of use, substantial completion, or date of notice of 
completion, whichever occurs first. This coverage does not protect against consumables, severe 
weather, and acts of God. 
 

Terms 
Terms are NET 30 with approved credit. For orders that exceed ten thousand dollars; 60% to 
initiate order, 30% upon substantial completion, and 10% upon completion, or progress billing 
based on purchase agreement at time of order. Payments made by credit card are subject to a 
3.0% fee. 
 
All applicable taxes are the responsibility of the purchaser and will be added to the final invoice. 
Any cancelled orders or returns are subject to manufacturer acceptance; shipping and restocking 
fees may apply. This proposal is valid for fourteen (14) days.  

 
Installation Description and Requirements 
Provided by CTI: If installation is purchased, CTI will install all A/V components. CTI will also 
perform all programming, alignments, and end-user training. CTI will provide A/V project 
management, and provide drawings as required. This install price assumes a Monday through 
Friday 8:00am to 5:00pm install time. Room availability must be in consecutive 8-hour blocks. 
Any required changes or rushes may affect the final price.  

 
Provided by Others 
Electrical requirements are to be provided by others unless specifically included in CTI Scope of 
Work.  
 

Statement 
This system proposal is the property of CTI and is delivered with the sole intent of being viewed 
by management of Town of Oakland for evaluation purposes only. This proposal or any part of 
this proposal is not to be presented to, or viewed by any other party, vendor, or CTI competitor 
without the written consent of CTI Any effort to do so will be considered a violation of copyright 
law. 
  



 

 

CONFIDENTIAL 
901-360-8332 | WWW.CTI.COM 

2013 Fletcher Creek Memphis, TN 38133 
  J24030218  |  6 

 

Next Steps 
 

1. Upon Notice to Proceed, CTI will begin executing the project plan with an internal handoff of 
the project to our operations team. 

 
2. If you have questions about the process as we move forward, please contact me at 

David.Perry@cti.com or 901-308-4299. 
 

3. You will be contacted by a CTI Project Manager to schedule a project kickoff meeting to 
review the project scope and schedule. 

 

Total 

J24030218 - $4,914.18 

 
 
 

Customer Signature 
 
 

 CTI Signature 

Printed Name 
 
 

 Printed Name 

Title 
 
 

 Title 

Date 
 

 Date 

 

 
 





Tenn. Code Ann. § 2-7-143 
Current through the 2023 First Extraordinary Session of the General Assembly. The Tennessee 

Code Commission may make editorial changes to this version and may relocate or redesignate 

text. Those changes will appear on Lexis Advance after the publication of the certified volumes 

and supplements. Pursuant to T.C.A. §§ 1-1-110, 1-1-111, and 1-2-114, the Tennessee Code 

Commission certifies the final, official version of the Tennessee Code. Until the annual issuance 

of the certified volumes and supplements, references to the updates made by the most recent 

legislative session should be to the Public Chapter and not T.C.A. Case annotations are current 

through September 15, 2023. 

• TN - Tennessee Code Annotated 
• Title 2 Elections 
• Chapter 7 Procedure at the Polling Place 

 

 

2-7-143. Tennessee Freedom of Speech Act. 
(a) This section shall be known and may be cited as the “Tennessee Freedom of Speech Act.” 

(b) Notwithstanding any law to the contrary, during the period beginning sixty (60) days before 

the first day voting begins pursuant to § 2-6-102(a)(1) for an election until the first day after 

voting ends for such election: 

(1) This state, a local government, or any other political subdivision of this state: 

(A) Shall not regulate the shape or quantity of political or campaign posters or signs placed on 

private property that is located more than one hundred feet (100′) from a polling place if the 

signs or posters are placed on the property by the owner of the property or any lawful resident of 

a residence on the property; 

(B) May prohibit, notwithstanding subdivision (b)(1)(A), any political or campaign poster or 

sign covered by this section from exceeding: 

(i) For commercial property, thirty-two square feet (32 sq. ft.) in size; and 

(ii) For residential property, sixteen square feet (16 sq. ft.) in size; and 

(C) Notwithstanding subdivision (b)(1)(A), may adopt reasonable restrictions limiting the 

number of political campaign signs or posters that may be placed on property; provided, that 

such restrictions authorize an owner or resident to place at least one (1) poster or sign on the 

property per candidate, issue, or subject; and 

(2) A homeowners' association shall not, by covenant, condition, restriction, or rule, prohibit the 

display of political or campaign posters or signs placed on private property by the owner of the 

property or any lawful resident of a residence on the property. A homeowners' association may 

adopt reasonable covenants, conditions, restrictions, or rules with respect to the placement and 

removal of political or campaign posters or signs placed on homeowner association common 

space and private property maintained by the owner or resident, including limiting the size of 

campaign posters or signs in those common and private property areas to four square feet (4 sq. 

ft.). 

(c) A lessor of residential property may require a lessee to obtain the written permission of the 

lessor prior to placing any political or campaign posters or signs on such residential property. 

Any such requirement must be included in the lease or rental agreement. 



(d) This section applies to any clause, covenant, condition, restriction, or rule contained in any 

agreement or contract between a homeowners' association and property owner or between a 

lessor and lessee executed or modified after July 1, 2017. 

 

 

 

History 
 

 
Acts 2017, ch. 294, § 1; 2021, ch. 93, § 1; 2022, ch. 626, §§ 1, 2. 
 
 
TENNESSEE CODE ANNOTATED 
Copyright © 2024 by The State of Tennessee All rights reserved 

 

Tenn. Code Ann. § 2-7-143 






















































